BID RESULTS
COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE:

JOB TITLE: Furnishing and delivery of office supplies for the County of Maui July 1, 2015 to December 31, 2015
IFB 14-15/P-94 .

i Hawall Stationery Go. (A} OficeMax Inc.(B)
ltem No. Description Estimated Requirement Unit Total Unit Total
{lowest sum bidder's item
number highlighted)
Adhesives
1|Permanent Glue Stick, nontoxic for use on .260z $0.42 $5.04 $1.71 $6.84
paper, cardboard, photos, polystyrene, (A) Avery #00216
fabric. Dries clear, wrinkle free, washable. {B).260z A100164 3/pk
Eberhard Faber UHU or equal 10z $1.23 $14.76 $5.82 $11.64
(A) Avery #00226
{B) 1.270z A198073 6/pk

Binders & Accessories —
1|Binder, 3 ring round, 1/2", K&M, Cover vinyl Black 15 each $1.23 $18.45 $3.35 $50.25
sealed over heavy gauge hoard with front (A} Cardinal #90300
and back pockets, double booster ring (B} L2ZOM0O2771
metals for easy opening and closing, sheet
size 11"x8.5"
21Binder, 3 ring round, 1:, K&M, Cover vinyl Black 150 each $1.23 $184.50 $3.35 $502.50
sealed over heavy gauge board with front and  ](A) Cardinal #90310
back pockets, double booster ring metals for {B) L20M02767
easy opening and closing, sheet size
11" x 8.5"
3|Binder, 3 ring round, 1.?7. K&M, Cover vinyl Black 25 each $2.02 $50.50 $4.15 $103.75
sealed over heavy gauge board with frontand  [(A) Cardinal #80320
Iback pockets, double booster ring metals for (B) L2OM02768
easy opening and closing, sheet size
11"x8.5"
4|Binder, 3 ring round, 2", K&M, Cover vinyl Black 25 each $2.34 353.50 $4.95 $123.75
sealed over heavy gauge board with front and  |{A)Cardinal #90330
back pockets, double booster ring metals for (BY L2ZOM02773
easy opening and closing, sheet size
11"x8.5"
5|Binder with label on spine, 3 ring round, 2", Black 35 each $ 256 § 8960 $ 4.95 173.25
K&M, Cover vinyl sealed over heavy gauge {A) Cardinal #90331
board with front and back pockets, double {B) L2OM02773
booster ring metals for easy opening and
closing, sheet size 11"x 8.5"
&|Binder, 3 ring round, T, K&M, Cover vinyl Black 60 each $ 402 § 24120 $ 6.1 366.60
sealed over heavy gauge board with front and  |(A) Cardinal #90340
iback pockets, double booster ring metals for (B} LZOMO02785
easy opening and closing, sheet size
11"x8.5", sheet lifters




7|Binder with label on spine, 3 ring round, 3", Black 25 each 434 § 10850 § 6.1 152,75
K&M, Cover vinyl sealed over heavy gauge (A} Cardinal #90341
board with front and back pockets, double (B) L2OM02785
booster ring metals for easy opening and
closing, sheet size 11"x 8.5", sheet lifters
81Insertable Mylar Tab Index by CASCADE, 150 set 035 § 5250 § 062 93.00
5-tab, clear, buff ledger stock reinforced with (A) Avery #11466
mylar, tabs 2" long, blank white inserts, sheet |(B)L3 11110
size 11"x 8.8", 3-hole punched
Qﬁnserlable Mylar Tab Index by CASCADE, 300 set 035 $ 105.00 $ 062 186.00
5-tab, colored, buff ledger stock reinforced with |{A) Avery #11465
mylar, tabs 2" long, blank white inserts, sheet |(B) L3 11109
|size 11"x 8.5", 3-hole punched
10]Insertable Mylar Tab Index by CASCADE, 100 set 0.58 § 5800 $ 094 94.00
8-tab, clear, buff ledger stock reinforced with (A) Avery #11486
miylar, tabs 1.5" leng, blank white inserts, sheet |(B) L3 11112
size 11"x 8.5", 3-hole punched
11|Insertable Mylar Tab Index by CASCADE, 250 set 058 § 14500 % 0.94 235.00
8-tab, colored, buff ledger stock reinforced with |(A) Avery #11467

mylar, tabs 21.5" long, blank white inserts, sheef
size 11"x 8.5", 3-hole punched

tI(B) L3 11111

Total Siim Bid'for Bindors'& Actessorie

3

Cards, index & rolodex

1]Index Cards, 3x5, Ruled One Side, White, 20 100/pack 059 § 11.80 $ 3.5 15.00
Hopaco 90lb, 8pt stock. ({A) Esselte #31
(B) F30OM99035 (4 500/pack}
2|index Cards, 4x6, Plain, White, Hopaco, 90Ib, 10 500/pack 102 % 10.20 $ 6.30 63.00
8pt stock. (A) Esselte #40
(B} F3OM99038
3|tndex Cards, 4x6, Ruled One Side, White, 10 500/pack 102 § 1020 $ 6.30 63.00
Hopaco, 90lb, 8pt stock. {A) Esselte #41 10 100/pack
(B) F3OM99037
4Findex Cards, 5x8, Plain, White, Hopaco, 90Ib, 10 500/pack 162 § 1620 $ 207 103.50
8pt stock. (A} Esselte #50 10 100/pack
{B) FAOM88039 50 100/pack
5[|Index Cards, 5x8, Ruled Cne Side, White, 10 500/pack 162 § 16.20 § 207 103.50
Hopaco, 90Ib, 8pt stock. {A) Esselte #51 10 100/pack
(B) F30M99040 50 100/pack
Total Sum Bld fof Indéx & Rolodax Cards: SR 64807 p+348.004




Clips, Clipl
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boards, Fasteners, Staples, Staplers

Clipboard, durable 1/8" brown hardboard,

{A) Officemate Intl. #99915
(B) HAOM99146

smooth 50 each $ 1.13 56.50 1.25 62.50
front and back, strong spring clip, 8"x 12-1/2"  |{A} Charles Leonard #389003
{B) F7TOMO01920
Clipboard, durable 1/8" brown hardboard,
smooth 10 each $ 1.18 11.80 1.75 17.50
front and back, strong spring clip, 9"x 15-1/2"  |(A) Charles Leonard #89004
}(B) FTOMO01921
Archboard, durable high density hardboard, 2" 25 each $ 4.21 105.2% 5.82 145.50
capacity arch, 9"x 14", arch locking mechanism, J{A) Saunders #05712
arches 2-3/4" center to center, 1/2" metal (B} FTOM01923
|hanging hele
Archboard, durable high density hardboard, 2 25 each $ 4,34 108.50 5.99 149,75
capacity arch, 9"x 17", arch locking mechanism, |(A) Saunders #05713
arches 2-3/4" center to center, 1/2" metal {B) Swingline F7OMD1924
hanging hole
Staples, Slandard, STANLEY BOSTICH, 114" 350 5M/box $ 079 276.50 2.47 379.75 |
legs, 1/2" crown, .019" wire, chise! point, 105 (A) #SB51914CP
staples per strip. (B} H135107 {175 5M/box)
Staples, Standard, STANLEY BOSTICH, 1/4" 50 5M/box $ 243 121.50 3.27 163.50
legs, 1/2" crown, .019" wire, chisel point, 105 (A} Swingline #35440
staples per half strip. {B) H135440
Staple Remover, steel prongs with plastic grips 75 each $ 0.50 37.50 0.60 45.00
{A) Charles Leonard #93050
(B} H1OM97112
Stapler, Full Strip, GBC Bates, opens flat for 10 each $ 3.65 36.50 411 4110
tacking, staple low supply indicator (A) Stanley Bostich #8515BK
{B) H10M97553
Stapler, Half Strip, Swingline Model H171101, 10 each $ 5.53 55.30 4,68 46.80
black, compact all metal construction, drop in  |(A) Stanley Bostich #8600BK
Jloading {B) HIOM97583
Paper Clips, No. 1, wire gauge .033, smooth 100 100/box $ 0.21 21.00 2.50 25.00
(A) Officemate Intl. #99911
(B) H4OM99149 (1000/pk 10pk 100/box)
Paper Clips, Jumbo, wire gauge .045, smooth 25 100/box $ 0.57 14.25 6.75 20.25
(A) Officemate intl. #99914
(B) H4OM99147
Paper Clips, Jumbo, wire gauge .045, rough 25 100/box $ 0.60 15.00 6.75 20.25




13|Binder Clips, 9/18" wide(mini), ACCO 200 12/box $ 022 § 4400 $ 120 § 48.00
{A) BSNG5364
{8} H4OM39801

1

o

Binder Clips, 3/8" wide, ACCO 150 12/box 3 - $ 125 % 62.50

(B) H4OM99802

15[Binder Clips, 578" wide, AGCO 100 12/box $ 026 § 2600 $ 210 $ 105.00
(A) BSN36550

{B) H4OM99803

o

16(Binder Clips, 1" wide, ACCO 50 12/box $ 950 § 123.50

(BYH4OM99274

16[Binder Clips, 1 174" wide, ACCO 50 12/box $ 064 § 600 § .50 §  66.50
{A) BSN36551
|(B)H4OMB5274

16[Binder Clips, 2° wide, ACCO 50 12/box $ 166 § 4225 § 950 § 6.50
(A} BSN36552
(BIHAOMS9274

Prong Fastener, Standard 1", ACCO, hole to
17|hole 20 50/box $ 244 § 4880 $ 169 § 33.80
2-3/4", unit includes broad base with attached |{A}Charles Leonard #R10
one piece prongs and a binding compressor, (B) H4OM99882

made of tempered steel.

Prong Fastener, Standard 2", ACCQO, hole to
18{hole 150 50/box $ 294 3% 44100 $ 199 § 298.50
2-3/4", unit includes broad base with attached |(A) Charles Leonard #R20
one piece prongs and a binding compressor, {B) H4OM99883

made of tempered steel.

19]Prong Base only, 1" capacity, hole to hole 2-3/4" 10 100/box $ 306 § 3060 $ 195 § 19.50
{for items 16 and 17) (A} Charles Leonard #811
{B) H4OM9H881
20|Prong Base conly, 2" capacity, hole to hole 2-3/4" 10 100/box 3 361 % 310 $ 245 § 24.50
{for items 16 and 17) (A) Charles Leonard #B21
(B) H4OM99887
21[Compressor only, hole to hole 2-3/4" 10 100/box $ 361 § 3610 § 245 § 24.50
{for items 16 and 17) (A) Charles Leonard #C1
(B) H4OMI743%
22|Avery Reinforcements, clear polyvinyl, 1/2" 50 200/box [ 160 $ 8000 § 110 § §5.00
diameter, 1/4" hole (A) Maco #MT500
(B) A505721

Total Sum Bld-for Clips, Clipboards; Fastenérs; Tapes; Staplors L TSR 044,707




Computer Supplies

Did not bid on all items in section

1|Disc, Recordable, CD-R, Recording Speed 48x, 10 Spindle no bid $ 28.00 § 280.00
Capacity Data/Audio 700MB/80Min., Silver,
Spindle, TDX, TDX-48555, 100/Spindle {B) 5748555
{no substitute)

2{Duster, Compressed Gas, Dust Off, 100z 10 each no bid $ 500 § 50.00
Fellowes #99790/ S60M04736

{B) SBUDS-10ms

3|Lexar JumpDrive TwistTurn USB Flash Drive, | 12 each no bid $ 14388 § 35712

8GB, Assorted Colors, 2 pack {B) Q326654 {24 each)

Total Sum Bidfor Computer Supplie
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Desktop items, Pads, Blotters, Pad Protecters, Book Ends, ETC.
1|3M Tape Dispenser, Scotch C-15, black, 20 each $ 377 § 7540 § 350 % 70.00
chip-proof plastic, weighted hase, holds 1/2" or [(A) #C15BK
3/4" tape in rolls 36 yards long with 1" core {B) ABOMS7058
3M Tape Dispenser, Scotch C-38, black, 10 each $ 2,67 § 286.70 §$ 250 § 25.00
high-impact plastic, weighted base, holds 1/2" orj(A) #C38BK
3/4" tape in rolls 36 yards long with 1" core {B) A8C38BK
3M Tape, Highland, Invisible Tape, #6200, 1/2", 50 roll $ 086 $ 4300 § 228 § 38.76
for mending, labeling and splicing. {A) #6200121296
(B) ABOMIB707 3/pk
3M Tape, Highland, Invisible Tape, #6200, 3/4", 750 roll $ 117 § 877.50 $ 279 % 697.50
for mending, labeling and splicing. (A) #56200341296
{B) ABOMI6708 3/pk
3M Tape, Scolch, Box Sealing Tape, #3710, 25 roll $ 192 § 4800 $ 755 % 37.75
2"x 55yd, general purpose, clear. (A) #371048MM50MCR
{B) AB3710-6 6/pk
3M Tape, Scotch, Box Sealing Tape, #3710, 10 roll $ 191 § 19.10  n/b No Tan
2"x 55yd, general purpose, tan. (A} #37T1048MMS0OMTN
3M Tape, Scotch, Filament Tape, #8959, 12 roll $ 1787 § 21444 5 456 § 54.72
2"x 55yd, for extreme packaging applications  [{A) #895%
(B) A8897-24mm




Scissors

t|Shears, Acme Recycle Kleen Earth Office 10 each $ 521 3 5210 % 185 % 18.50
Shears, K3-44218, Plastic Handle/SS edge, 7" |{A) ACME #44218
Length, 2-1/4" ¢ul {B) H3OMI7680

2|Shears, Acme Elite Stainless Steel Scissors, 6 each $ 894 § 5364 §$§ 550 $ 33.00

cuts metal, fabric, paper, and cardboard, 8" {A) ACME #41318
length, straigh, orange handle,

H341318(Hopaco)
3)Shears, Acme Adjustable Office Stainless Steel 6 each $ 8.07 § 48.42 No Bid
Scissors, 8" length, straight, Tension
Adjustment (A} ACME #11138
to cut various material thicknesses, 5 year (B} H3OMD1998
limited warranty H311138{Hopaco)
Desk Trays
1|Desk Tray, front load, stackable, Tenex, black 10 each $ 444 % 4440 § 410 % 41.00
10-3/4"L x 12-5/8"W x 3"H {A) Officemate Intl. #21032
{B) K321032
2|Desk Tray, side load, stackable, Tenex, black 10 each $ 236 § 2360 $ 220 % 22.00
letter size {A) Officemate Intl. #21002
{B) K3210020
3[Desk Tray, side load, stackable, Tenex, black 10 each $ 452 % 4520 § 430 % 43.00
legal size (A) Officemate Intl. #21102

(B) K3211020

Total Sum Bid for Desktop’




Envelopes
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Envelope, clasp, 6.5"x 9.5", 28Ib brown kraft,
securely anchored rust resistant metal clasp,

{B) P278125

fully gummed flap. 70 100/box 11.25 78750 § 8.00 $ 560.00
{A) Quality Park #37863
{B) P277963

Envelope, clasp, 9" x 12", 28Ib brown kraft,

securely anchored rust resistant metal clasp,

fully gummed flap. 10 100/box 9.94 9940 § 10,00 ¢ 100.00
{A) AMP #73108
{B) P278990

Envelope, clasp, 10" x 12.5", 28lb brown kraft,

securely anchored rust resistant metal clasp,

fully gummad flap. 100 100/box 14.96 1,496.00 $ 11.00 $ 1,100.00
(A) Quality Park #37893
(B) P277993

Envelope, clasp, 10"x 13", 28Ib brown kraft,

securely anchored rust resistant metal clasp,

fully gummed flap. 10 50/box 14.33 14330 % 12.00 $ 120.00
{A) Quality Park #C0997
{B) P278997

{Envelope, clasp, 10" x 157, 28Ib brown kraft,

securely anchored rust resistant metal clasp,

fully gummed flap. 100 50/box 18.66 1,866.00 § 14.00 $ 1,400.00
{A) Quality Park #37898
(B) P277998

White wove, regular flap, solid glue strip on flap,

24# 500/box No.10 25 box 11.05 27625 $ 11.00 % 275.00
{A) AMP #3213

Total Sum:BId for Envelop

$:3,655.00 .




Filing Supplies, Sterage Boxes
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Fellows bankers storage box, 15"L x 12"W x
10"H insdie dimensions, lift off lid, large labeling

(A) Smead #75114

area, {ote handles, letter/legal, cloud white 50 each $  23.24 96.91 16.50 $82.50
{A) #00703 12 per case
(B) P5OM97210 12 per case

Fellows bankers storage box, R-Kive, double

wall sides and bottom, triple-walt ends, padded

tote handles, smooth rolled edges, letter/legal,

woodgrain 750 each $ 3.50 2,625.00 4958 § 3,123.54
{A) #00725 12 par case
(B) P500725 12 per case

File pocket, letter size, 5-piece, Redrope

gussets, 11-3/4" wide x 9-1/2" high, drop front

with straight cut tab, front and back reinforced

with manila liner, 3-1/2" capacity, 50 per box 150 each $ 0.90 135.00 1350 % 202.50
(A) Smead #73805
(B) F10M01552 10 per box

File pocket, letter size, 5-piece, Redrope

gussets, 11-3/4" wide x 9-1/2" high, drop front

with straight cut tab, front and back reinforced

with manila liner, 5-1/4" capacity, 50 per box 300 each $ 0.95 285.00 16.50 % 495.00
{A) Smead #73810
(B} F1OM0O1553 10 per box

File pocket, legal size, 5-piece, Redrope

gussets, 14-3/4" wide x 9-1/2" high, drop front

with straight cut tab, front and back reinforced

with manila liner, 1-3/4" capacity, 50 per box 100 each $ 0.90 90.00 -
(A) Smead #74800

File pocket, legal size, 5-piece, Redrope

gussels, 14-3/4" wide x 9-1/2" high, drop front

with straight cut tab, front and back reinforced

with manila liner, 3-1/2" capacity, 50 per box 100 each $ 0.90 50.00 19.50 § 195.00
{A) Smead #74805
(B) F1OM01554 10 per box

File pocket, legal size, 5-piece, Redrope

gussets, 14-3/4" wide x 9-1/2" high, drop front

with straight cut tab, front and back reinforced

with manila liner, 5-1/4" capacity, 50 per box 100 each $ 0.96 96.00 1775 § 177.50
(A} Smead #74810
(B) F10M01555 10 per box

End tab expandinﬁe pocket, letter, 1-3/4" cap,

Smead, manifa, front 9-1/2 pt., back is 11pt.,

plain, straight cut, 5/8" wide, self tab. 15 5/box $ 4453 667.95 -
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End tab expanding file pocket, legal, 1-3/4" cap,
Smead, manila, front 9-1/2 pt., back is 11pt.,

(A} ACCO #16046
(B) F116046

plain, straight cut, 5/8" wide, self tab. 35 5/box 50.31 1,760.85 -
{A) SMD76114

Tuff Pocket End Tab File Pocket, 2-ply Tabs, 5

1/4" Expansion, Straight Cut, Extra Wide Legal

Size, Dark Brown 35 5/box 43.10 754.25 -
(A) SMD747%0

Cascade manila folder, letter size, 1/3 cut, 11pt.

Stock, single thickness tab. 100 100/box B.72 672.00 10.00 1,000.00
(A) Smead #10346
{B) F1ODB10838

Cascade Manila folder, legal size, 1/3 cut, 11pt.

Stock, singie thickness tab. 125 100/box 9.06 1,132.50 7.36 920.00
(A} Smead #15346
(B) F1OM97184

Esselte manila folder, legal size, 173 cut,

assorted, double thickness tab. 10 100/box 20.23 202.30 18.09 180.90
{A) Smead #16334
(B} F1OM01841

[Esselte manila folder, letter size, straight,

double thickness tab. 10 100/box 17.81 176.10 16.00 160.00
{A) Smead #10310
{B) F1OM01972

Esselte manila folder, legal size, straight, doublel

15'lhickness tab. 10 100/box 20.79 207.90 22.50 225.00

(A) Smead #15310
{B) F1OM01956

Classification folder, legal size, Tyvek bound 25

paint pressboard stock, two center leaves

create three 1" capacity sections, includes 6

fasteners, earth red 100 100/hox 31.17 3,117.00 44.50 445.00
{A) ACCO #16036
{B) FIOM01620

Classification folder, legal size, Tyvek bound 25

point pressboard stock, two center leaves

create three 1" capacity sections, includes 6

fasteners, leaf green 100 100/box 29.52 2,952.00 67.00 B70.00
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Classification folder, legal size, Tyvek bound 25
point pressboard stock, two center leaves
create three 1" capacity sections, includes 6

{A) Smead #71353

fasteners, mist gray 100 100/box 20.62 % 2,9562.00 67.00 % 670.00
(A} ACCO #16056
(B) F116056

Classification folder, legal size, Tyvek bound 25

point pressboard stock, two center leaves

create three 1" capacity sections, includes 6

fasteners, sky blue 100 100/box 317§ 3,117.00 67.00 $ 670.00
{A) ACCO #16026
(B) F116026

Classification folder, legal size, Tyvek bound 25

point pressboard stock, two center leaves

create three 1" capacity sections, includes 4

fasteners, earth red 100 100/box 2747 % 2,747.00 4825 $§ 482.50
(A) Smead #18775
(B) F1OMO01537

Classification folder, legal size, Tyvek bound 23

point presshoard stock, 2" expansion, 2

dividers, includes 2 fasteners, light blue 100 100/box 4061 § 4,061.00 7325 % 732.50
(A) Smead #26781
(B) F114030

Classification foider, letier size, 11-3/4"W x

10"H overall, cover 20pt. Colored pressboard

stock with Tyvek gusset, 2" pront "K" style

fasteners on inside front and back covers, two

dividers per folder, 17pt. Kraft stock, 1/3cut, 3/8"]

high, assorted tab, 1" twin pront fastener on

both sides of divider, cover color red 100 100/box 38.41 § 3,841.00 -
{A) Smead #14031

Pressboard Fastener Folders, 2" Expansion, -

Legal Size, 60% Recycled, Gray/Green 10 25/box 650,27 § 503.70 69.35 % 693.56
{A) Smead #19934
(B) SMD 14981

Color Hanging Folders, Legal Size, Brights 10 25/pack 1599 § 159.90 21.00 $ 210.00
(A) Esselte 81632
{B) F54153 1/5 Asst

Color Hanging Folders, Letter Size, Brights 10 25/pack 12.08 § 120.80 1877 % 187.70
{A) Essolte 81612
{B) F54152 1/5 Asst

Expanding wallet, 3102 expansion, Redrape

gusset, letter, 11-3/4" x 9-1/2", leather like

material, elastic cord closure sections, includes

4 fasteners, earth red 120 each 314 § 376.80




rExpanding wallet, 5-1/4" expansion, Redrope
gusset, Attorney, 15" x 10", leather like materal,
elastic cord closure sections, includes 4
27|fasteners, earth red 200 each $ 428 % 42800 % -
Jia) cL10766GLHD

Qutcards, Oxford by Esselte, legal size, salmon
colored, 11pt. Stock, printed on both sides with

28[charge out record 2 100/box $ 4213 § 8426 $ 2400 $ 48.00
(A) PENDAFLEX 2051
(B) C22051
findex fabs, Avery gummed, reinforced cloth,
29|gray, #59-112, 1/2" round 80 50/pk $ 178 § 14000 § 207 § 165.60
{A} #59112

)'Sum Bid:for Filing-Suppl 1:$733;592:

Did nol bid on all
Labels items in section
Printer Labels

Label, 1" x 2-5/8", white, 24%, 30 per sheet,
sheet 8-1/2" x 11", 750/labels per pack, shests
feed from paper tray of most laser printers. Self .
1]adhesive, 1" x 2-5/8" 25 pack 750/pk $ 360 § 9000 S 883 $ 220.75
(A) Maco #ML3025
{B) A55260
Label, 1" x 2-5/8", white, 24#, 30 per sheet,
sheet 8-1/2" x 11", 3000/labels per pack, sheets
feed from paper tray of most laser printers. Self
2|adhesive, 1" x 2-5/8" 25 pack 3000/pk $ 8.88 § 22200 % 2950 § 737.50
{A) Maco #ML3000
(B) A55160
Label, 1" x 4", white, 24#, 20 per sheet, sheet 8-
12" x 11", 2000/1ables per pack, sheets feed
from paper tray of most laser printers. Seif
3]adhesive, 1"X". 7 pack 2000/pk $ 8.88 % 6216 § 3000 § 210.00
{A) Maco #ML2000
(B) A55161
Label, 3-1/3" x 4", white, 24#, 6 per sheet, sheet
8-1/2" x 11%, 600/labels per pack, sheets feed
from paper tray of most laser printers. Self
4|adhesive, 1"x 5/8" 7 pack 600/pk $ 9.00 § 63.00 $ 3025 % 211.75
{A} Maco #ML0600
(B} A55164
File Folder Labels -
Label, file folder, self adhesive, approx. 3-7/16"X
9/16", Colored horder on plain white, 248 label
1|per box 5 -
Dark Blue 40 box FFL5 $ 133 ¢ §3.20
Green 40 box FFL8 $ 133 § §3.20
Purple 30 box FFL10 $ 133 § 39.90
Red 40 box FFL2 $ 132 § 53.20
Orange 10 box FFL7 $ 133 § 13.30
Yellow 30 box FFL3 $ 133 § 39.90
White 10 box FFL1 $ 1.33 § 13.30




Electronic Labels

DYMO D1 Electronic Label Maker Tape, 0.5 " x
1123 § each $ 1278 § 25560 3 1625 3 325.00

(A) 45010

Black on Clear (B} A545010
{A) 45013

Black on White {B) AB45013
{A) 45015

Red on White {B) AB45015
{A) 45021

White on Black {B) A545021

Total Stim Bid ofr LAbals: 9587

id not bid on al
items in section

Miscellaneous Supplies

Batter, alkaline, AA, RAYOBAC 220 2/pk $ 138 § 30360 § 13.00 $ 481.00

(A) Sanyo SNFSECAC4AA

{B) LOMN15RT122 12 per pack

-

cassette, standard, 60 min, 3M, for use in tape
recorders, dictating units and some telephone
2|answering machines 80 each $ 263 § 21040 § 249 3 199.20
(A} SPR51060
(B) M&51060

casselte, standard, 680 min, 3M, for use in tape
recorders, dictating units and some telephone

3|answering machines 225 each $& 276 § 62100 § 259 3 582.75
{A) SPR51090
{B) M651090
4|Wipes, antiseptic, phone cleaning, $6-99721 6 12/pk $ 396 § 2376 § 375 § 22.50
{A) REARR1203
(B) S6RR1203
Wipes, Surface, for all ABS plastic office
5lequipments, $699705 (Hopaco} 6 65/tub $ 428 % 2568 § 400 § 24.00
(A) Fellowes 99705
(B) SBOMI6800
Fingertip Moisteners, Lee Sorwik, 3/80z,
615310050 {(Hopaco) 12 each $ 116 § 1382 & 250 § 10.00
{A) Lee Sortwlk 10050
{B) A910053 3/pk

Xacto Knife, X-acto No. 1 Precision Z-Series
7|Knife with Safety Cap 12 each $ 449 § 5388 % 325 % 39.00
(A) Elmers EP1X23601
{B) J1X3602

Total Sum Bd for Miscellansous Suppiles: "+ ¥ $ 135845




Paper Pads, Notebooks, Add Rolls

—_

™

e

[+2]

-~

Legal pads, 8-1/2" x 11-3/4", headstrip style,
canary, top 3/4" perforated for removal,

clipbeard backing, 50 sheet/pad, 12 pad/pack. 100 pack 9.86 § 986.00 §& 8.40 840.00
{A) Tops #7632406
(B) P3OM97315

Legal pads, 8-1/2" x 14", headstrip style,

canary, top 3/4" perforated for removal,

clipboard backing, 50 sheet/pad, 12 pad/pack. 25 pack 13.66 § 33875 § 13.15 328.75
(A) Tops #7572
(B) P3OM97322

Jr. Legal, 5" x 8", headstrip style, canary, 15lb

paper, 28pt. Chipboard backing, P3C58CP, 50

sheet/pad, 12 pad/pack 4 pack 488 § 1952 § 7.00 28.00
(A) Tops #7501A82
(B) P3OMO7330

Executive style stenographers notebook, spiral

bound, 8" x 9", Gregg ruled, red centerline 750 pad 086 § 645.00 $ 14.25 897.75
(A) Mead 43080
(B) P3OM97333 12/pk

Phone Memo; message book, 11" x 5-1/2"

page, 4 messages per page, each message 2-

part carbenless, spiral bound, 400 sets per

5|book. 75 book 395 § 23625 § 6.00 450.00

{A) Tops #4003
(B) PIOMS87302

|Notebook; single subject, 11" x 8-1/2" page, 80

sheets, kraft cover assorted colors, wirelock no

snag spiral binding, medium weight paper,

standard ruling. 150 book 194 § 29100 & 0.39 133.50
(A) Mead #06622
(B) P3OMO03885

Adding machine roll, 2-1/4", 165 per roll, easy

open closure, red warning signal at end of roll 750 roll 050 § 37500 § 070 525.00
{A) Tops #7280
{B) P4OM97630

Total Sum Bld for.Paper Paus;Noteboaks  Add-Rolls: «.




Pens, Pencils, Markers, Erasers

s

[

[

s

o

[=-]

o2

Pen, Pentel, "RSVP", 0.7mm, stainless tip,
ruberized grip, refillable.

1 dozen
{A) #BKI0A
{B) N1BKS0A

6.05

6.06

6.256

6.25

Pen, Ball, Pilot, black, fine., tungsten carbide
ball inside stainless steel tip, refillable, "better
ballpoint pen”.

1 dozen
(A) #35011
{B) N135011

8.79

8.79

10.37

10.37

Pen, Ball, Pilot, black, med., tungsten carbide
ball inside stainless steel tip, refillable, "better
ballpoint pen".

1 dozen
(A) #3571
{B) N135711

8.79

8.79

10.43

10.43

Pen, Ball, Pilot, black, extra find 0.5, P-500,
writes through carbon

4 dozen
{A) P1L38600
{B) N138600

64,72

17.76

71.00

Pen, Uni-ball 207 Retractable Fraud Prevention
Gel Pen, Medium Point, 0.7 mm, Black Barrels,
Black Ink

4 dozen
{A) 33950
{B) N133950

1.31

62.88

19.50

78.00

Pen EBERHARD FABER, Uniball, deluxe micro,
black, 0.2mm micre fine line, metal roller point
with waterproof non fading ink, window in barrel

80 dozen
(A) SANGOD25
(B) N160025

147.834

23.50

188.00

Pen EBERHARD FABER, Uniball, deluxe micro,
red, 0.2mm micro fine line, metal roller point
with waterproef non fading ink, window in bairel

8 dozen
{A) SANGOD26
{B) N160026

147.84

23.50

188.00

Pen EBERHARD FABER, Uniball, deluxe micro,
Iblue, 0.2mm micro fine line, metal roller point
with waterproof non fading ink, window in barrel

2 dozen
(A) SANGOO27
{B) N160027

1.54

36.98

23.50

47.00

Pen, Papermate, flexgrip, medium, rubberized
barrel with ring grip area, chrome tip, refiltable

8 dozen
(A} #9530131
{B) N19630131

1.07

102.72

13.55

108.40




11

13

14

16

Pen, Papermate, flexgrip, fine, rubberized barrel

with ring grip area, chrome tip, refitlable 8 dozen 0.84 80.64 § 1355 § 108.40
{A) #9680131
{B) N19680131
Pen, Pilot, Bettergrip, cushion grip balipoint pen,
Hepaco #N1-30050, medium, black refillable. 8 dozen 5.22 4176 § 996 % 79.68
{A) #30050
(B) N132010
Pen, Pilot, Easy Touch, form fitting rubber grip,
Hopaco #N1-32300, broad, btack refillable, 8 dozen 6.45 5160 % -
(A) #32300
Pen, Pilot, G-2 Retractable Gel Pen, 0.7mm,
Fine Point, Clear Barrels, Blue Ink 8 dozen 1.09 10464 § 1699 135.92
{A) #31021
(B) N131021
Pen, Pilot, Precise V5 Liquid Ink Retractable
Rotlerball Pen, Extra Fine Poirt, 0.5 mm,
Metallic Silver/Blue Barrel, Blue Ink 8 dozen 1.37 13152 § 2155 172.40
(A} #26063
(B) N126062
Pen, Pilot, Precise V5 Liquid Ink Retractable
|-Rollerball Pen, Extra Fine Point, 0.5 mm,
15|Metallic Silver/Purple Barmrel, Purple Ink 8 dozen 1.37 131.52 § 2817 22536
{A) #26066
(B) N126066
Pen, Pilot, Precise V5 Liguid Ink Retractable
Rollerball Pen, Extra Fine Point, 0.5 mm,
Metallic Silver/Red Barrel, Red Ink 8 dozen 1.37 131.52 $ 30.88 247.04
(A) #26064
{B) N126064
Pen, Sanford Uniball Gel Impact, rubber grip,
window, gel ink, black, bold, Hopaco #N1-65800 8 dozen 1.73 16608 § 29.30 234.40
(A) #65800
Pen, retractable, PaperMate, flexgrip, ball point,
18|medium, black, 95301 6 dozen 1.04 7488 § 15.64 93.84
{A) #9530131

(B) #9530131




Pen, Dry erase, SANFORD EXPO, blue, find

19|bullet tipped, N284003 {Hopaco} 4 dozen 1.03 4944 § 1765 70.60
(A) SAN84003
{B) N286003
Highlighter, SANFORD MAJOR ACCENT,
vellow, broad tipped, bright see thru color, non-
20]toxic, quick dry, smudge resistant 40 dozen 6.21 24840 % 7.20 288.00
(A) #25005
{B) N225005
Highlighter, SANFORD MAJOR ACCENT,
fluorescent yellow, broad tipped, bright see thru
21jcolor, non-toxic, quick dry, smudge resistant 40 dozen 6.21 24840 3% 720 288.00
(A) 25025
{B) N225025
Highlighter, SANFORD MAJCR ACCENT, pink,
broad tipped, bright see thru color, non-toxic,
22{quick dry, smudge resistant 12 dozen 6.21 24840 § 7T.20 288.00
(A) #25009
(B) N225009
Highlighter, SANFORD MAJOR ACCENT,
fluorescent orange, broad tipped, bright see thru
23|color, non-toxic, quick dry, smudge resistant 12 dozen 8.21 7452 3§ 7.20 86.40
{A) #25006
(B) N225006
Pen style marker, Sharpie, black, fine
permanent, water resistant, nontoxic, quick dry,
marks on metal, glass, foil, plastic, and photo
24|fllm, quick dry 10 dozen 0.76 91.20 $ 11.00 110.00
(A} #30001
{B) N230001
Pen style marker, Sharpie, red, fine permanent,
water resistant, nontoxic, quick dry, marks on
metal, glass, foil, plastic, and phote film, quick
25]dry 8 dozen 0.76 7296 § 11.00 88.00
{A) #30002
{B) N230002
Pen style marker, Sharpie, blue, fine
permanent, water resistant, nontoxic, quick dry,
marks on metal, glass, foil, plastic, and photo
2gffilm, quick dry 1 dozen 0.78 912 § 11.00 11.00
(A) #30003

(BY N230003




27

28

29

30

3

ury

32

33

Pen style marker, Sharpie, green, fine
permanent, water resistant, nontoxic, quick dry,
marks on metal, glass, foil, plastic, and photo

{A) #13883

film, quick dry 1 dozen 0.76 9.12 14.00 11.00
{A) #30004
{B) N230004

Pen style marker, Sharpie, black, extra fine

permanent, water resistant, nontoxic, quick dry,

marks on metal, glass, foil, plastic, and photo

film, quick dry 4 dozen 0.76 16.48 10.93 43.72
{A) #35001
{B) N235001

Permanent marker, chisel tip, black, smear

proof, water resistant, marks on almost any

surface, color coded gripping area 40 dozen 3.74 149.80 476 190.40
(A) Sanford #64291
(B) N20D89837

Permanent marker, chisel tip, blue, smear proof,

water resistant, marks on almost any surface,

color coded gripping area 4 dozen 3.74 14.96 5.33 21.32
{A) Sanford #64293
{B) N20D87497

Permanent marker, chisei tip, red, smear proof,

water resistant, marks on almost any surface,

color coded gripping area 4 dozen 3.74 14.96 7.70 30.80
{A) Sanford #64292
{B)y N208887

Permanent marker, chisel tip, green, smear

proof, water resistant, marks on almost any

surface, color coded gripping area 4 dozen 3.74 14.96 5.33 21.32
{A) Sanford #64294
{B) N20Da7498

Pencil, general wiiting, wood barrel, bonded

lead, soft pink eraser, PMA cerlified non-toxic 1.96 3.92 -

No.1-Scft 2 dozen
{A) D1X13081

No.2-Medium/soft 200 dozen 1.56 312.00 1.13 226.00
(A) #2097
(B) NSOMS7010

No.2-1/2-Medium/firm 25 dozen 1.56 39.00 2.60 65.00
(A} #2098
(B) N52098

No.3-Firm 1 dozen 1.87 1.87 -




Eraser cap, Eberhard Faber arrowhead,

N673015 3 144/byg $ 481 § 1443 § 935 § 28.05
{A) Papermate #73015

34

Eraser, smudge-free, soft, pink & pliable, cblong
beveled, medium size, "Pink Pearl"#100 20 each $ 036 § 720 5 159 % 11.13
(A} Paparmate #70520
(B} N670502

33

Eraser, smudge-free, soft, pink & pliable, oblong
36|beveled, large size, "Pink Pearl'#101 20 each $ 043 § 860 $ 961 % 19.22
(A) Papermate #70521

(B) N670521

43:902:45
Oid not bid on all
items in section

Total Sum Bid for Pens;

Rubber Bands

1|Premium Crepe, 1# Box $ 479 % 4790 % 413 § 41.30

#16, 2-1/2" x 1/16" 10 box
{A) HSCRB16
{B) A6OMO70186

#18, 3" x 1/18" 10 box $ 479 § 4790 $ 413 § 41.30
(A) HSCRB18
{B) AGOMO7017

#19, 3-1/2" X 116" 2 box $ 479 § 958 $§ 413 § 8.26
(A} HSCRB19
{B) A6OM0O7018

|#32, 3" X 18" 4 box $ 479 § 1916 % 413 § 16.62
{(A) HSCRB32
(B) AGOMO7019

#33, 3-1/2" X 1/8" 4 box $ 479 $§ 1916 $ 413 § 16.52
{A) HSCRB33
{B) ABOM07020




Pure Rubber, 1/4# box

_7'\',

#16, 2-1/2" X 1/16" 5 box $ 135 § 875 $ 116 § 5.80
{A) HSCRB016
(B) ASOM07008

le1s, 3" x 116" 10box $ 135 § 1350 § 116 § 11.60
{A) HSCRB018
(B} A6GOMD7009

#19, 3-1/2" X 116" 5 box $ 135 § 675 § 116 § 5.80
(A} HSCRB019
{B) AGOMD7010

#19, 3-1/2" X 1/32" 2 box $ 135 % 270§ 116 % 2.32

(A) HSCRBO19
(B) A6OMD7010
l#az2, 3" x 1/ 2 box $ 135 § 270§ 116 § 2.32
{A) HSCRB032
{B) AGOM07011

l#a3, 3-1727 X 18 5 box $ 135 § 675 $ 116 § 5.80
(A) HSCRBO33
{B) AGOM07012

#64, 3-1/2" X 1/4" 10 box $ 1.35 § 13.50 $ 116 $ 11.60
(A) HSCRBOG4
(B) AGOMOT013

#54, Assorted 20 box $ 135 § 2700 $ 145 §  29.00
(A) HSCRB1054
l (B) AB5414LB ]

L

Big Band, Pack of 12 70 12 pack T 005 § 950 § 0.50 § 5.00
(A) Alliance 00700
7X 18" (B) AGOMO7024

[Total Sum Bid for-Rubber Bands;

Rulers
Hardwood, single bevel, 1 metal edge, 1/16"
1}markings

(N 12" 20 each $ 0.83 § 1660 § 100 § 20.00
{A) ACME 05011
(B) CM99440

(2} 18" 6 each $ 1.24 § 744 § 215 § 12.90
{A} ACME 05018
{B) 05018

Total Sum Bld for Ruiers: :




Tape Flags & Post It Notes

-

N

Self Adhesive, removable, 1" x 1-2/3",

50/dispenser

a. Blank flags

Red 30 each 1.99 59.70 4.20 63.00
(A) 6801

{B) 100/dispenser (B)A2680RD2 15 ea.

Blue 25 each 1.99 49.75 4.20 105.00
(A) 6802

(B} 100/dispenser (B) A2680BB2

Green 40 each 1.99 79.60 4.20 168.00
(A) 6803

(B) 100/dispenser (B) AZ680BG2

Orange 10 each 1.99 19.90 4,20 42.00
(A) 6804

(B} 100/dispenser (B) AZ6B00E2.

Yellow 25 each 1.99 49.75 4.20 105.00
(A) 6805

(B} 100/dispenser (B) A2680YW2

White 10 each 1.99 19.90 4.20 42.00
(A) 6806

(B} 100/dispenser (B) A26B0WE2

Purple 40 each 1.99 79.60 4.20 168.00
(A) G808

(B} 100/dispenser (B) A2680PU2

"Sign Here” Yellow 35 each 1.99 69.65 9.75 175.00
(A) 6809

(B) 100/dispenser (B) A268HVSH

Self Adhesive, removable, 3/8" x 1-7/10", 150

removable flags, 5 colors, 30 of each color per

dispenser, colors are standard red, blue, yellow,

orange and green 25 each 3.82 95.50 4.05 101.25
(A) 6834

(B) AZ6834




Self Adhesive, removable, 2-1/4' x 8/16", 120
per dispenser, "Sign Here flags, red, printed at

N

on

-J

3|right for right page usage. 25 each H 3.33 § 8325 § 317 § 79.25
(A} 81024
{B) A2684RDSH
Post It Notes; 2 x 1-1/2, yellow, 100 sheets per
4|pad, pack of 12 pads 50 pack $ 1.79 § 8950 $ 164 3§ 82.00
(A} 6539YW
{BYOM99213
Post It Notes; 2 x 3, yellow, 100 sheets per pad,
pack of 12 pads 40 pack $ 18.53 § 4120 5§ -
J(A) BSN2074356
Post It Notes; 3x3, vellow, 100 sheets per pad,
pack of 12 pads 25 pack $ 3.99 § 99.75 § 431 § 107.75
(A) 6549YW
(B) A40D33184
Post It Notes; 3x5, yellow, 100 sheets per pad,
pack of 12 pads. 20 pack $ 5.49 § 10980 § 531 § 10.20
(A) 6559YW
(B) A40D354

TotalSuim Bid for Tape Flags and Post It NOtes

Typewriter Supplies{includes correction tape fluid)

items in section

L]

w

Tape, Correction & Cover up, double 1}-“,
1{secure yet removable 25 roll $ 233 § 5825 % 279 % 69.75

(A) 3M 652
(B} A8652

Correction tape, MONO Tombow, cOMpact

dispenser, sideways application, for any paper,

1/6" x 394", canary 100 each $ 204 ¢ 20400 3 225 % 225.00
{A) TOME8620
{B) A968620

Correction Fluid, LIQUID PAPER, 18mi, white,

12 botile per hox 300 each $ 113 § 32900 §$ 1710 § 427.50
(A) PAP5640115
(B) A95640115

601.25 1722:254

Bid Summaries emailed to:
Managing Director
Directer of Finance
Corporation Counse!
Council Chariman

Opened by:

Witnessed by:

[/&‘-\ﬁ.q/“\

Greg King, Central hurchasing Agent

Greg King

Jared Masuda




