BID RESULTS

COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE: 01/28/2016

[

JOB TITLE: Expendable Foodservice Products for Senicor Services (February 1, 2016 - Jul)ir 31, 20186)

IFB 15-16/P-T0

“£.Triple F {C)

legtio * Quantity

KAUNOA

1 60 CASE

2 50 CASE

3 50 CASE

4 50 CASE

§ 20 CASE

§ 10 CASE

7 20 CASE

8 20 CASE

9 1 CASE

10 10 CASE

11 100 CASE

12 60 CASE

13 60 CASE

14 5 CASE

15 2 CASE

16 10 CASE

- Destiption .

Southland foeam tray, five compartment, 8" x
10", 500/case, TH1-0500, SCMPT FOAM
TRAY, TENNECO

A) W710500

Styrofoam tray with cover, medium, 3
compartments

hinged lid, 200/case, TENNECO B80-215
A} W7NT3

Plastic fork, med.-heavy weight, 100/pack,
10 per case
B) #3640

Plastic spoon, med. Weight, 1,000/case,
100/pkg., 10/case

B) #3642

Dispenser napkin, 8" x 13-1/2", 10000/case,
JR501 FY tall fold

C) JR501

Aluminum foil, pop-up sheet, 12" x 10-3/4",
500 sheets/box, 6 boxes/case, 721
REYNGLDS

OEG-100, disposable gloves, large,
4650530, 10 boxes/case (prefer pop-up - no
rolls)

A) WB15261

Food tray, 1/2 |b., 171000

Food tray, 11b., 1/1000

Styrofoam bowls, 8oz. (F8 1100510)
B) DART 85J20

Styrofeam cups, 60z.,DART 6J6, 1000/cs
A) WTEBE

Plastic container, 5 oz. cup size, 1000/case
HFKSCC

By #FKECC

Lids for 5 oz. plastic container, 1000/case
#.5CC

Dawn, Joy, Palmolive dish detergent, 10-12
oz., assorted

Chopsticks, individuat paper wrapped

Sugar, individual packets, 3000/case

$19.69

$14.90

$38.20

$20.95
$25.98

$53.46

$21.00

$107.89

$87.20

$46.00

$77.90

$14.90

$2,100.00; .

$23.85

$6,461.40 * $98.40
$5,232.00 $91.40
$230.00 $41.65
$155.80 61.60
$148.00 - 13.65

56.83 $2.841.50
NO BID
$14.73 $736.50
$14.73 $736.50
36.46 729.20
$16.00 $160.00
§16.00 $320.00
$36.45 $729.00
29.76 20.76
$56.13 $581.30
$2,385.00 $34.50  $3.450.00
$6.904.00 . - $10874  $6.404.40
$5.484.00 $49.43  $2,966.80
207.76 - NO BID NO BID
$123.20°° $60.42 $100.84
$136.60. $14.08 $140.60



$456.00 *" NO BID

17 10 CASE Cream, 11 oz. {lite} $46.60 . NO BID
A) AT00020 i
18 10 CASE  Cofiee, 8 oz., Decaffeinated $39.00 $33.60 $336.00 | NO BID NOBID
B) #1181012 C
19 10 CASE ?g‘:‘e": Koire, med -heavy weight. 100/pack. $14.90 $149.00 (" $10.50 106.00 /- $1473 314730
B) #3641 L
20 1CASE  Plastic/wood coffee stirrers $16.90 $16.90 $24.10 $24.10 j'.’t $21.09 $21.08
H |
A} W737501 :
i
21 1 CASE :;;:(Iy facial tissue, dispenser size, pop-up $23.66 $36.00 $36.00 - $19.67 $19.67
22 10 CASE  Tea bags, 100/box, 10 boxes/case $8.95 $11.85 4.16 $41.60
23 10 EACH Coffee Percolators 20-35 cup $92.00 NO BID
A) ATCP30
24 2 CASE ;h:ii;\ti;tgrip", reclosable bag 4" width x 6" $18.28 £22.40 $22.40 < NO BID NO BID
A) W4F20406 ’ i
25 10 CASE  Clorox, 16 0z, {or 5 case 32 oz.} hottles $17.40 $17.40 $27.00 $27.00° 7 NO BID NO BID
A) W32071
26 2 CASE  Plastic Sandwich Bag 5"x6" Zip-l.ock top $16.99 $43.60 $87.20. NOBID
A} WAHOTRC
27 5 CASE  Press & seal wrap, dispenser ty box $16.95 $13.40 87.00 ; NO BID
B) VALUE WRAP
28 CASE oo oo™ covered 3 compartment food $41.97 $4840 8400 $57.00  $570.00
A) WTHLS3 '
Paper plate; Valley, #22026 Valley, 5 $69.00 $690.00 75,00 760.00 . ) 70.35 703 50
29 10CASE compartment luau tray, 10-1/2 x 8-1/2 _ s $76.00 $760.00 $70.35 $703.50
AWTTL1S ,
30 5 CASE _l:\i;:]ar dinner plate, foam, non-sectional, 10 $61.15 $92.75 463.75‘j= : 88.58 42.90
i $463.75 §88.58 $442.90
A)WTPL10 ;
31 5CASE  Cream, individual serving package $18.95 $13.40 ;;_l_m 13.59 $13.5¢
1 10 CASE 5 compartment lunch tray, foam 8" x 10" $64.24 $642.40 ;. 58.05 580.50 : $56.64
A) W710500 W
2 2CASE fgosé;‘;:::dwich bag 8X8, 2.0 mil ZIPLOCK $54.60 $108.20 $69.95 $130.00. NOBID NO BID
A) W4F 20808
3 10 CASE ??:gz::;:-a;ed’“eaw waight, 100/pack, $16.03 $160.30 $1155 311550 $15.58 $155.80
A) W7A10000826 :
420ase  Dispensernapkins, 8 x 13-1/2", §43.93 $87.88 44.10 $88.20 $36.46 $72.92

10000/case, SCOTT 98710
A) WBST713



5 1 CASE

& 20 CASE

7 2 CASE

8 4 CASE

9 4 CASE

10 2 CASE

11 10 CASE

12 2 CASE

13 20 CASE

14 4 CASE

16 2 CASE

16 2 CASE

17 4 CASE

18 20 CASE

19 5 CASE

20 5 CASE

21 2 CASE

Aluminum fail, pop-up sheet, 12" x 10-3/4",
500 sheets/box, 6 boxes/case, 721
REYNOLDS

A) W8J10003028

Styrofoam deep trays with cover, 3
compartments, 200/case, AMOCO #80-663

A) W7DF883PB

QEG-100 disposable gloves, large,
1000/case, 10 boxes/case, prefer pop-ups -
no rolls

A} Wa15261

Multi-fold paper towels, 9.4" x 9.25", white
4000/case

AWSE131761

Trash can liner, 33 gal., 33x39, low density
poly, 1.75 mil, 200 bag/case

A} KBPT334022B

Toilet tissus, rolls, 2-ply, 500 shest/roll, 96
rolls/case
A) W5513721

Paper hot cup, with handle, 8oz., 1000/case
A) W7SDR8OLDW

Clorox disinfectant, 6 gallons/case
A) W32071

Paper plates, M23-7992, diamond deluxe,
12 pkg-20 trays each, 10-1/2x8-1/2x1, 5
compartment, luau tray

A)WTITL1S

Paper towel, roll, double ply
A) W5ST852

Tea bags, 100/box, 10 boxesfcase
A) AT00291

Plastic spoon, med. Weight, 100/pack, 10
packs/case
A WTPTMWS1D

Press and seal wrap, dispenser type box

A) WBVW182

Biodegradable, 3 compariment covered tray,

paper
A) WTHLB3

Boz. Styrofoam bowl
A) W78FC20

8oz. Styrofoam bow! lid
A) WTLVFC20

Cream - Individual serving packet
A) A700022

$68.86 bl $101.30 M

$20.15 $403.00 $26.40 $528.00 NO BID
$20.40 §$117.60 $30.30 $121.20

$46.20 $92.401 $67.00 |

$76.00 s1,szo.oo'-; 900 $1580.00
$34.00 $35.70 $142.80.
$18.34 §73.38° $15.45 PLE K0 A
$48.25 $50.80 $1,016.00
$32.60 $182.50 $26.40 $132.00

$20.26 $40.60 $14.70 $20.40

$16.00

$16.00

$22.50

$44.74

$50.95

$42,55

$20.57

§56.64

$25.00

$15.58

$57.00

$16.00

$32.00

$80.00

$178.96

$101.80

$426.60

$41.14

$1,132.80

$100.00

$31.16

$1,140.00

$290.65

§$142.55

$27.18



22 10 CASE  Styrofoam Cups, & oz., 1000/cs $24.16 $241.50 - $25.52 $255.20 $33.46 $334.60

A) WT6B6

TAL. LUMP SUM B1D FOR FTEMS 1

THRU 217 7%,

i"ch]'nét- :Eiaﬁo’ﬁ*ali'i;t ms

KALAUPAPA AND KAUNAKAKAL

1 10 CASE Foam cups, 8 oz., foam cups, 1000/case $42.55 $425.50

A) W78B8

2 40CASE  Styrofoam desp try with cover, 3 $20.16 $806.00 26.40 1,056.00 ' NO BID NO BID
compariments, 200/case, AMOCO #80-663 = —_— £26.40 §1.056.00 -
A} W7DF883PB
Southland foam trays, 5 compartments, 8" x 2.4 2 s

310CASE | 0", 500/case, AMOCO #70.255 $54.24 $542.40 $58.05 $56.64 $566.40
A) WT10500

4 4 CASE Plastic fork, med.-heavy weight, 100/pack, $16.03 $64.12 $11.55 $46.20 i $15.58 $62.32

10 packs/case i
A) W7A10000825 i

5 2 CASE :;s;i%ggoon, 5" 1000/case, L5-1, Winkler $11.37 $22.74 $11.55 $23.10! ' 15.68 $31.16
A) W7PTMWS10 s
Dispenser napkins, 8" x 12-1/2°, 43.93 87.6 _E
6 2 CASE 10000/case, SCOTT 88710 $43.9 $87.86 ] $44.10 §88.20;_5 $36.46 $72.52
A) WEST?13 -
Aluminum foil, pop-up sheet, 12" x 10-3/4",
7 2CASE 500 sheets/box, 6 boxes/case, 721 $68.86 $101.30 $202.60° $16.00 $32.00
REYNOLDS :
A) WBJ10003028
OEG-100 disposable gloves, large, }
8 2CASE  1000/case, 10 boxes/case GAUN prefer pop- $17.50 $19.50 39.0 $16.00 $32.00
ups - no rolls
A) WB15261
9 2 CASE :'Iolgg}?;z:aper towel, 9.4" x 9.25", white, $29.40 $58.80 $30.30 $60.60 §22.50 45.00
A) WS6131781 '
Toilet tissue: Kimberly Clark S5 #0446, rolls,
10 2 CASE  2-ply, 500 sheetiroll, 96/case, 45lbs., 4-1/2 x $46.20 $67.00 $134.00° $50.95 $101.90
4.1/2 .
AYW5131721
11 § CASE  Tea bags, 100/box - 10/box - 10 boxes/case $7.80 $12.65 $63.25- . $4.16 $20.80
A} A700291 -
12 10 CASE ::':zetrr:;ate, #22025 Valley, 5 compartmant $54.24 $542.40 $79.00 790.00 ' 56.64 566.40
A) W710500
13 10 CASE :::i;'r;f:ei‘:“"’d- biodegradable, 3 $48.26 $482.60 50.80 $508.00 $57.00 $570.00
A) W7HLB3 g
14 2CASE  Trash Liner, low-density 33x39 MB 33 §31.50 $63.00 $36.80 $73.60 $43.70 $67.40

A) K6PT334022b

15 2 CASE  Clorox disinfectant, 6 gallons/case $20.10 $40.20° - $19.90 $39.80 $20.57 $41.14




A) W32071

Plastic comainer, § oz, cup, , o :
16 2CASE | o “oNAIner. 2162 cp FKscC $117.00 $234.001° $110.20 $220.40 $106.74 $213.48

A) WTFKSCC

17 2CASE  Plastic lid, for § oz, cup, L5CC, 1000/case $94.00 $102.35 $204.70 . $45.31 $90.62

A) WTLSCC

18 2 CASE  Sugar - individual packet, 2000/case
A) A700021

Press and seal wrap, dispenser type, 10/140
sq. ft./case

A) WBVW182

19 2 CASE

TOTAL LUMP SUM BID FOR ITEMS 1
: THRU19 - ) : i
Tentative low bidder - In Bold

Bid Summaries emailed to:
Managing Director
Director of Finance
Corporation Counsel
Council Chariman

Opened by:

Witnessed by:

L&n_.\___/\,—\‘
Greg King, Central Purchasing Agent




